
MINNESOTA
PRICING SCHEDULE

(Typed responses required)

12/2015

Vendor Name:
Contact Person:
Street Address:
P.O. Box:
City, State, Zip
Phone #:
Toll Free #:
Fax #:
Email Address: GovContractSupport@JohnDeere.com

SPEC # REQUESTED INFORMATION ANSWER

1.0 TRACTOR CATALOG SECTION PRICE PRICE LIST TITLE: FR_Tran_20151109.pdf

DATE AND ID# OF PRICE LIST: FR_Tran_20151109

PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT TO BE APPLIED TO PRICE LIST: 17%

1.1 Price for manuals, (service, parts, repair,  and operations) N/A

1.2 Price for set of fluid and air filters N/A

2.0 PERFORMANCE/EXTENDED WARRANTY OPTIONS
Offer performance/warranty options.  Numbers starting with 2.1, 2.2,  etc.
(Specify years, miles or hours extended term covers.)

2.1 ______________________________________________ No Bid
2.2 ______________________________________________ No Bid

3.0 INSTALLATION - PER HOUR N/A
Installation services may be requested on an "as needed" basis.
See Special Terms and Conditions

4.0 NEW EQUIPMENT RENTAL PROGRAM
If rental programs are available on the new equipment offered, with the option to purchase, list the 
hourly/weekly/monthly rental rate.  Indicate the percent of rental fee paid by the purchaser that will be 
applied to the purchase price.  See Solicitation Special Terms & Conditions.

Hourly Rental Rate: No Bid
Weekly Rental Rate: No Bid
Monthly Rental Rate: No Bid

Percent (%) of Rental Fee applied to purchase price: N/A

If the new rental equipment is purchased and finance
charges are applicable for the actual rental term only,
state the actual interest rate here:  ___N/A_____________

5.0 VENDOR OWNED RENTAL RETURN OR DEMO EQUIPMENT PROGRAM
See Special Terms and Conditions.
DEDUCT cost per Used Hour from the original Contract Price No Bid

6.0 PERCENTAGE DISCOUNT OFF LIST PRICE FOR RELATED PARTS  & ACCESSORIES 

 See Special Terms and Conditions

0% for incidental miscellaneous 
non-contract items; 17% for 
attachments/accessories on 
contract.

7.0 DELIVERY STARTING POINT -                                            City, State, Zip
Location of delivering John 
Deere dealer

See Special Terms and Conditions - No flat rate allowed               $4 per loaded mile

800-358-5010, option 2
800-358-5010, option 2
309-749-2313

Deere & Company
Tamara Hebert
2000 John Deere Run

Cary, NC 27513

mailto:GovContractSupport@JohnDeere.com


HT1224 - 24 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single
Rear Braked Axle
Steel, All-Welded Joints,
Fixed Upper and Lower Bars

Tricycle Front Axle
Single Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axle
11,200 lb. (5080 kg) GVWR
All-Wheel Fenders
Telescoping Tongue
2-5/16 In. Ball Coupler
7-Pole RV Plug
Highway Transport Lighting and Markings

Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires
Manufacturer's Certificate of Origin
(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
4001XF HT1224 - 24 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle

Ready to license transport.
Can be pulled at marked roadway speeds.
Electric brakes with breakaway.

7,853.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Ball Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Ball Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

185.00

2020 Front Steer Axle - Braked (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Electric brake axle with breakaway.

407.00

2030 Suspension & Braked Front Steer Axle (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Electric brake axle with breakaway.

592.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1224 - 24 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle
Equipment for Base Machine

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED ...Continued...

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
One set of 2.

206.00

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 720.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
1 set of 2 Brackets.

397.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000101 2-5/16 In. Ball Couple Hitch 169.34

5MM9H000057 24 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 831.60

5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM5H000106 Braked Front Tricycle Axle 1,046.01

5MM5H000172 Braked Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,594.08

5MM9H000032 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2) 237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000097 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT12X000000 - XFHT12X900074.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1224 - 24 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle
Continued

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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HT1228 - 28 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single
Rear Braked Axle
Steel, All-Welded Joints,
Fixed Upper and Lower Bars

Tricycle Front Axle
Single Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axle
11,200 lb. (5080 kg) GVWR
All-Wheel Fenders
Telescoping Tongue
2-5/16 In. Ball Coupler
7-Pole RV Plug
Highway Transport Lighting and Markings

Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires
Manufacturer's Certificate of Origin
(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
4002XF HT1228 - 28 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle

Ready to license transport.
Can be pulled at marked roadway speeds.
Electric brakes with breakaway.

8,442.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Ball Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Ball Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

185.00

2020 Front Steer Axle - Braked (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Electric brake axle with breakaway.

407.00

2030 Suspension & Braked Front Steer Axle (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Electric brake axle with breakaway.

592.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1228 - 28 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle
Equipment for Base Machine

09 November 2015 US & Canada
1



CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED ...Continued...

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
One set of 2.

206.00

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 720.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
1 set of 2 Brackets.

397.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000101 2-5/16 In. Ball Couple Hitch 169.34

5MM9H000058 28 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 831.60

5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM5H000106 Braked Front Tricycle Axle 1,046.01

5MM5H000172 Braked Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,594.08

5MM9H000032 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2) 237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000097 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT12X000000 - XFHT12X900074.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1228 - 28 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle
Continued
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HT1232 - 32 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single
Rear Braked Axle
Steel, All-Welded Joints,

Fixed Upper and Lower Bars
Tricycle Front Axle
Standard Duty:

Single Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axle
(Tandem Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axles Optional)

Heavy Duty:
(Tandem Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axles Optional)

11,200 lb. (5080 kg) GVWR
16,800 lb. (7620 kg) with Tandem (Std Duty)
20,000 lb. (9071 kg) GVWR (Heavy Duty)

All-Wheel Fenders
Telescoping Tongue
2-5/16 In. Ball Coupler
7-Pole RV Plug
Highway Transport Lighting and Markings
Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires

ST235/80R16 LRE 10 ply Import Radial Tires (Heavy
Duty)
Manufacturer's Certificate of Origin
Standard Duty:

(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets

Heavy Duty:
(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
Optional Draper Brackets (draper brackets are
used with
616C and 618C Corn Heads to better distribute
weight)

(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
4003XF HT1232 - 32 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle

Tandem braked axles optional.
Ready to license transport.
Can be pulled at marked roadway speeds.
Electric brakes with breakaway.
To not exceed axle weight limitations, tandem rear axles are required for Transports used with
12-row and larger corn heads.

8,946.00

GROSS WEIGHT CAPACITY
0998 Gross Vehicle Weight Capacity up to 16,800 Lbs., Standard Duty

Ideal for transporting all John Deere Heads except for 616C and 618C corn heads.
In Base Price

0999 Gross Vehicle Weight Capacity up to 20,000 Lbs., Heavy Duty
Ideal for transporting the 616C or 618C corn heads.

3,573.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Ball Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Ball Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1232 - 32 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle
Equipment for Base Machine

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

185.00

2020 Front Steer Axle - Braked (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Electric brake axle with breakaway.

407.00

2030 Suspension & Braked Front Steer Axle (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Electric brake axle with breakaway.

592.00

2040 Heavy Duty Front Steer Axle-Idler In Base Price

2050 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 220.00

2060 Heavy Duty HT1232-42 Braked Steer Axle 423.00

2070 Heavy Duty HT1232-42 Suspension and Braked Front Axle 643.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

8102 Heavy Duty Mounted Spare Tire 247.00

8301 Addition of Second Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axle, Tandems
Electric brakes with breakaway.
Tandem rear axle required if transporting 12-row and larger corn heads (to carry additional
weight).

1,842.00

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
One set of 2.

206.00

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 1,076.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
1 set of 2 Brackets.

397.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000101 2-5/16 In. Ball Couple Hitch 169.34

5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM9H000060 32 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 1,242.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1232 - 32 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle
Continued

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION ...Continued...
5MM5H000108 Additional Rear Axle (HT1232) 2,843.79

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM5H000106 Braked Front Tricycle Axle 1,046.01

5MM5H000172 Braked Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,594.08

5MM9H000065 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Heavy Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

5MM9H000032 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

5MM5H000210 Heavy Duty Braked Front Steer Axle 1,065.65

5MM5H000205 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 1,453.68

5MM5H000211 Heavy Duty Suspension Braked Front Axle 1,564.61

5MM5H000212 Heavy Duty Transport Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire 299.76

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
Standard Duty Only; Heavy Duty trailer includes Draper Brackets, 1 left and 1 right Slider
Attachment.

237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000097 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT12X000000 - XFHT12X900074.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1232 - 32 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle
Continued

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1232 - 32 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Single Rear Braked Axle
Continued

THIS PAGE IS INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK
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HT1238 - 38 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem
Rear Braked Axle
Steel, All-Welded Joints,

Fixed Upper and Lower Bars
Tricycle Front Axle
Tandem Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axles
16,800 lb. (7620 kg) GVWR (Std Duty)
20,000 lb. (9071kg) GVWR (Heavy Duty)
All-Wheel Fenders
Telescoping Tongue
2-5/16 In. Ball Coupler
7-Pole RV Plug
Highway Transport Lighting and Markings
Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires (Std
Duty)
ST235/80R16 LRE 10 ply Import Radial Tires (Heavy
Duty)
Manufacturer's Certificate of Origin

Standard Duty:
(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs
Heavy Duty:

(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
Optional Draper Brackets (draper brackets are
used with
616C and 618C Corn Heads to better distribute
weight)

(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
4004XF HT1238 - 38 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles

Ready to license transport.
Can be pulled at marked roadway speeds.
Electric brakes with breakaway.

11,528.00

GROSS WEIGHT CAPACITY
0998 Gross Vehicle Weight Capacity up to 16,800 Lbs., Standard Duty

Ideal for transporting all John Deere Heads except for 616C and 618C corn heads.
In Base Price

0999 Gross Vehicle Weight Capacity up to 20,000 Lbs., Heavy Duty
Ideal for transporting the 616C or 618C corn heads.

1,858.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Ball Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Ball Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension 185.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1238 - 38 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Equipment for Base Machine

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

FRONT STEER AXLE ...Continued...
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

2020 Front Steer Axle - Braked (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Electric brake axle with breakaway.

407.00

2030 Suspension & Braked Front Steer Axle (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Electric brake axle with breakaway.

592.00

2040 Heavy Duty Front Steer Axle-Idler In Base Price

2050 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 220.00

2060 Heavy Duty HT1232-42 Braked Steer Axle 423.00

2070 Heavy Duty HT1232-42 Suspension and Braked Front Axle 643.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

8102 Heavy Duty Mounted Spare Tire 247.00

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
One set of 2.

206.00

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 1,076.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
1 set of 2 Brackets.

397.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000101 2-5/16 In. Ball Couple Hitch 169.34

5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM9H000061 38 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 1,242.00

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM5H000106 Braked Front Tricycle Axle 1,046.01

5MM5H000172 Braked Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,594.08

5MM9H000065 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Heavy Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1238 - 38 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Continued
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION ...Continued...
5MM9H000032 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

5MM5H000210 Heavy Duty Braked Front Steer Axle 1,065.65

5MM5H000205 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 1,453.68

5MM5H000211 Heavy Duty Suspension Braked Front Axle 1,564.61

5MM5H000212 Heavy Duty Transport Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire 299.76

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2) 237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000097 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT12X000000 - XFHT12X900074.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1238 - 38 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Continued

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1238 - 38 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Continued
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HT1242 - 42 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem
Rear Braked Axle
Steel, All-Welded Joints,

Fixed Upper and Lower Bars
Tricycle Front Axle
Tandem Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axles
16,800 lb. (7620 kg) GVWR (Std Duty)
20,000 lb. (9071kg) GVWR (Heavy Duty)
All-Wheel Fenders
Telescoping Tongue
2-5/16 In. Ball Coupler
7-Pole RV Plug
Highway Transport Lighting and Markings
Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires (Std
Duty)
ST235/80R16 LRE 10 ply Import Radial Tires (Heavy
Duty)

Manufacturer's Certificate of Origin
Standard Duty:

(4) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets

Heavy Duty:
(4) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
Optional Draper Brackets (draper brackets are
used with
616C and 618C Corn Head to better distribute
weight)

(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
4005XF HT1242 - 42 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles

Ready to license transport.
Can be pulled at marked roadway speeds.
Electric brakes with breakaway.

13,979.00

GROSS WEIGHT CAPACITY
0998 Gross Vehicle Weight Capacity up to 16,800 Lbs., Standard Duty

Ideal for transporting all John Deere Heads except for 616C and 618C corn heads.
In Base Price

0999 Gross Vehicle Weight Capacity up to 20,000 Lbs., Heavy Duty
Ideal for transporting the 616C or 618C corn heads.

1,596.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Ball Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Ball Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.

185.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1242 - 42 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Equipment for Base Machine

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

FRONT STEER AXLE ...Continued...
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

2020 Front Steer Axle - Braked (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Electric brake axle with breakaway.

407.00

2030 Suspension & Braked Front Steer Axle (HT12 Series)
In lieu of standard idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Electric brake axle with breakaway.

592.00

2040 Heavy Duty Front Steer Axle-Idler In Base Price

2050 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 220.00

2060 Heavy Duty HT1232-42 Braked Steer Axle 423.00

2070 Heavy Duty HT1232-42 Suspension and Braked Front Axle 643.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

8102 Heavy Duty Mounted Spare Tire 247.00

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (4)
Two sets of 2.

412.00

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 1,431.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
2 set of 4 Brackets.

795.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000101 2-5/16 In. Ball Couple Hitch 169.34

5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM9H000062 42 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 1,652.40

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM5H000106 Braked Front Tricycle Axle 1,046.01

5MM5H000172 Braked Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,594.08

5MM9H000065 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Heavy Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1242 - 42 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Continued
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION ...Continued...
5MM9H000032 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

5MM5H000210 Heavy Duty Braked Front Steer Axle 1,065.65

5MM5H000205 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 1,453.68

5MM5H000211 Heavy Duty Suspension Braked Front Axle 1,564.61

5MM5H000212 Heavy Duty Transport Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire 299.76

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
Standard Duty Only; Heavy Duty trailer includes Draper Brackets, 1 left and 1 right Slider
Attachment.

237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000097 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT12X000000 - XFHT12X900074.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1242 - 42 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Continued
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FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1242 - 42 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Continued
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HT1248 - 48 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem
Rear Braked Axle
Steel, All-Welded Joints,

Fixed Upper and Lower Bars
Tricycle Front Axle (Idler) with Fenders
Tandem Rear Torsion Flex Axle with Brakes on Both
Axles with Fenders
20,000 lb. (9071 kg) GVWR
Telescoping Tongue
2-5/16 In. Ball Coupler
7-Pole RV Plug
Highway Transport Lighting and Markings
Safety Chains

Tie Down Package (2 adjustable tie downs)
ST235/80R16 LRE 10 ply Import Radial Tires
Manufacturer's Certificate of Origin
(4) John Deere Cornhead/Rigid Platform/Flex
Platform Combination Slider Brackets (with bases).
Optional John Deere Draper Platforms with bases

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
4006XF HT1248 - 48 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles

Ready to license transport.
Can be pulled at marked roadway speeds.
Electric brakes with breakaway.

17,566.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Ball Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Ball Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2040 Heavy Duty Front Steer Axle-Idler In Base Price

2050 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 220.00

2080 Heavy Duty HT1248 Braked Steer Axle 410.00

2090 Heavy Duty HT1248 Front Suspension and Braked Steer Axle 625.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (4)

Two sets of 2.
412.00

8102 Heavy Duty Mounted Spare Tire 247.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1248 - 48 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Equipment for Base Machine

09 November 2015 US & Canada
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED ...Continued...
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 1,431.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
2 set of 4 Brackets.

795.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000101 2-5/16 In. Ball Couple Hitch 169.34

5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM9H000063 48 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 1,652.40

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM9H000065 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Heavy Duty HT12 Series) 43.92

5MM5H000289 Heavy Duty Front Braked Steer Axle (HT1248) See Parts

5MM5H000290 Heavy Duty Suspension and Braked Steer Axle (HT1248) See Parts

5MM5H000212 Heavy Duty Transport Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire 299.76

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
Standard Duty Only; Heavy Duty trailer includes Draper Brackets, 1 left and 1 right Slider
Attachment.

237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1248 - 48 Ft. Highway Head Transport with Tandem Rear Braked Axles
Continued
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HT1124 - 24 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with
Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow Only
Steel, All-Welded Joints,
Fixed Upper and Lower Bars

Tricycle Front Axle
Single Rear Torsion-Flex Axle
11,200 lb. (5080 kg) GVWR
Telescoping Tongue
Clevis Hitch with 1 In. Hitch Pin
7-Pole Tractor Plug
Farm Implement (Ag) Lighting and Markings

Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires
(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
400AXF HT1124 - 24 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow Only

To be pulled by tractor only.
Maximum speed 20 mph (32 km/h).
No brakes, no fenders.

6,929.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Clevis Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Clevis Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

185.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

8400 Front Fender 226.00

8450 Rear Fenders, 1 Set of 2, Single Rear Axle 194.00

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
One set of 2.

206.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1124 - 24 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow
Only

Equipment for Base Machine
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED ...Continued...

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 720.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
1 set of 2 Brackets.

397.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM9H000057 24 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 831.60

5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM9H000031 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT11 Series) 37.37

5MM5H000049 Front Fender 264.60

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2) 237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000098 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000149 REAR FENDERS (2)
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.

213.14

5MM5H000099 Rear Fenders, 1 set of 2, Single Rear
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

213.14

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM5H000100 Welded Clevis Hitch with Pin No Tongue 120.66

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1124 - 24 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow
Only

Continued
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HT1128 - 28 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with
Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow Only
Steel, All-Welded Joints,
Fixed Upper and Lower Bars

Tricycle Front Axle
Single Rear Torsion-Flex Axle
11,200 lb. (5080 kg) GVWR
Telescoping Tongue
Clevis Hitch with 1 In. Hitch Pin
7-Pole Tractor Plug
Farm Implement (Ag) Lighting and Markings

Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires
(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
400BXF HT1128 - 28 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow Only

To be pulled by tractor only.
Maximum speed 20 mph (32 km/h).
No brakes, no fenders.

7,444.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Clevis Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Clevis Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

185.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

8400 Front Fender 226.00

8450 Rear Fenders, 1 Set of 2, Single Rear Axle 194.00

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
One set of 2.

206.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1128 - 28 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow
Only

Equipment for Base Machine
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1



CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED ...Continued...

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 720.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
1 set of 2 Brackets.

397.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM9H000058 28 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 831.60

5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM9H000031 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT11 Series) 37.37

5MM5H000049 Front Fender 264.60

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2) 237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000098 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000149 REAR FENDERS (2)
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.

213.14

5MM5H000099 Rear Fenders, 1 set of 2, Single Rear
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

213.14

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM5H000100 Welded Clevis Hitch with Pin No Tongue 120.66

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1128 - 28 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow
Only

Continued
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HT1132 - 32 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with
Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow Only
Steel, All-Welded Joints,
Fixed Upper and Lower Bars

Tricycle Front Axle
Standard Duty:
Single Rear Torsion-Flex Axle
(Tandem Rear Torsion-Flex Braked Axles Optional)
Standard Duty:
11,200 lb. (5080 kg) GVWR
16,800 lb. (7620 kg) GVWR

Telescoping Tongue
Clevis Hitch with 1 In. Hitch Pin
7-Pole Tractor Plug

Farm Implement (Ag) Lighting and Markings
Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires
Standard Duty:
(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
400CXF HT1132 - 32 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow Only

Tandem axles optional.
To be pulled by tractor only.
Maximum speed 20 mph (32 km/h).
No brakes, no fenders.
To not exceed axle weight limitations, tandem rear axles are required for transports used with
12-row cornheads.

7,979.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Clevis Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Clevis Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

185.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

8300 Addition of Second Rear Torsion-Flex Axle, Tandems 1,204.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1132 - 32 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow
Only

Equipment for Base Machine
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED ...Continued...
Tandem rear axle required if transporting 12-row and larger corn heads (to carry additional
weight).

8400 Front Fender 226.00

8450 Rear Fenders, 1 Set of 2, Single Rear Axle 194.00

8451 Rear Fenders (4) 388.00

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
One set of 2.

206.00

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 1,076.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
1 set of 2 Brackets.

397.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM9H000060 32 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 1,242.00

5MM5H000105 Additional Rear Axle 2,329.58

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM9H000031 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT11 Series) 37.37

5MM5H000049 Front Fender 264.60

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2) 237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000098 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000149 REAR FENDERS (2)
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.

213.14

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1132 - 32 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow
Only

Continued
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION ...Continued...
5MM5H000099 Rear Fenders, 1 set of 2, Single Rear

S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.
213.14

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM5H000100 Welded Clevis Hitch with Pin No Tongue 120.66

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1132 - 32 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow
Only

Continued
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FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1132 - 32 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Single Rear Axle - Tractor Tow
Only

Continued
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HT1138 - 38 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with
Tandem Rear Axle - Tractor Tow Only
Steel, All-Welded Joints,
Fixed Upper and Lower Bars

Tricycle Front Axle
Tandem Rear Torsion-Flex Axles
Standard Duty:
16,800 lb. (7620 kg) GVWR
Telescoping Tongue
Clevis Hitch with 1 In. Hitch Pin
7-Pole Tractor Plug
Farm Implement (Ag) Lighting and Markings

Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires
Standard Duty:
(2) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets
(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
400DXF HT1138 - 38 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Tandem Rear Axles - Tractor Tow

Only
To be pulled by tractor only.
Maximum speed 20 mph (32 km/h).
No brakes, no fenders.

10,004.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Clevis Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Clevis Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

185.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

8400 Front Fender 226.00

8451 Rear Fenders (4) 388.00

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1138 - 38 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Tandem Rear Axles - Tractor Tow
Only

Equipment for Base Machine
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED ...Continued...
8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)

One set of 2.
206.00

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 1,076.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
1 set of 2 Brackets.

397.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM9H000061 38 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 1,242.00

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM9H000031 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT11 Series) 37.37

5MM5H000049 Front Fender 264.60

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2) 237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000098 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000149 REAR FENDERS (2)
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.

213.14

5MM5H000099 Rear Fenders, 1 set of 2, Single Rear
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

213.14

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM5H000100 Welded Clevis Hitch with Pin No Tongue 120.66

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1138 - 38 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Tandem Rear Axles - Tractor Tow
Only

Continued
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION ...Continued...
5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)

Standard Duty Transport Only.
329.28

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1138 - 38 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Tandem Rear Axles - Tractor Tow
Only

Continued
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FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1138 - 38 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Tandem Rear Axles - Tractor Tow
Only

Continued
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HT1142 - 42 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with
Tandem Rear Axle - Tractor Tow Only
Steel, All-Welded Joints,

Fixed Upper and Lower Bars
Tricycle Front Axle
Tandem Rear Torsion-Flex Axles
Standard Duty:
16,800 lb. (7620 kg) GVWR
Heavy Duty:
20,000 lb. (9071 kg) GVWR
Telescoping Tongue
Clevis Hitch with 1 In. Hitch Pin
7-Pole Tractor Plug
Farm Implement (Ag) Lighting and Markings
Safety Chains
ST225/75R15 LRE 10 Ply Import Radial Tires (Std
Duty)
ST235/80R16 LRE 10 ply Import Radial Tires (Heavy

Duty)
Standard Duty:

(4) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets

Heavy Duty:
(4) Deere Platform/Cornhead Header Mounting
Brackets

Optional draper brackets
(draper brackets are used with 616C and 618C Corn
Head to better distribute weight)
(2) Ratchet Strap Tie-Downs

CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

Select One Code From Each Required Category

BASE MACHINE
400EXF HT1142 - 42 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Tandem Rear Axles - Tractor Tow

Only
To be pulled by tractor only.
Maximum speed 20 mph (32 km/h).
No brakes, no fenders.

12,492.00

GROSS WEIGHT CAPACITY
0998 Gross Vehicle Weight Capacity up to 16,800 Lbs., Standard Duty

Ideal for transporting all John Deere Heads except for 616C and 618C corn heads.
In Base Price

0999 Gross Vehicle Weight Capacity up to 20,000 Lbs., Heavy Duty
Ideal for transporting the 616C or 618C corn heads.

1,966.00

HITCH
1000 Long Telescoping Clevis Hitch (71 In.)

In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.
Same Price

1010 Short Telescoping Clevis Hitch (46 In.) In Base Price

1020 Long Telescoping Pintle Hitch (71 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

1030 Short Telescoping Pintle Hitch (46 In.)
In lieu of standard short telescoping hitch.

51.00

FRONT STEER AXLE
2000 Front Steer Axle - Idler In Base Price

FRONTIER PRODUCTS
Transports

HT1142 - 42 Ft. Low-Speed Farm Head Transport with Tandem Rear Axles - Tractor Tow
Only

Equipment for Base Machine
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CODE
ATTACHMENT
IDENTIFIER DESCRIPTION

SUGGESTED
LIST PRICE

USD ($)

FRONT STEER AXLE ...Continued...

2010 Front Steer Axle - Suspension
In lieu of stander idler axle.
Rubber Torsion Suspension Axle.

185.00

2040 Heavy Duty Front Steer Axle-Idler In Base Price

2050 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 220.00

SPECIAL EQUIPMENT - FACTORY INSTALLED
8101 Mounted Spare Tire 234.00

8102 Heavy Duty Mounted Spare Tire 247.00

8400 Front Fender 226.00

8401 Heavy Duty Front Fender 226.00

8451 Rear Fenders (4) 388.00

8452 Heavy Duty Rear Axle Fenders (4) 388.00

8455 John Deere Draper Brackets (4)
Two sets of 2.

412.00

8456 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

305.00

ATTACHMENTS - ORDERED AS DESIRED
9525 Top Rail Extension Kit 1,431.00

9526 FHT Stalk Brackets for Slider Base with pins
2 set of 4 Brackets.

795.00

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION

Miscellaneous:
5MM5H000102 3 In. Pintle Hitch without Tongue 138.51

5MM9H000062 42 Ft. Top Rail Extension Kit 1,652.40

5MM5H000148 Adjustable Rachet Straps (1) 157.92

5MM9H000066 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Heavy Duty HT11 Series) 37.37

5MM9H000031 French Operator's Manual and Decal Kit (Standard Duty HT11 Series) 37.37

5MM5H000049 Front Fender 264.60

5MM5H000209 Heavy Duty Front Fender 264.60
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LIST PRICE

USD ($)

ATTACHMENTS FOR FIELD CONVERSION ...Continued...
5MM5H000205 Heavy Duty Front Suspension Axle-Idler 1,453.68

5MM5H000212 Heavy Duty Transport Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire 299.76

5MM5H000200 Heavy Rear Fenders, Per Axle 427.40

5MM5H000160 John Deere Draper Brackets (2)
Standard Duty Only; Heavy Duty trailer includes Draper Brackets, 1 left and 1 right Slider
Attachment.

237.60

5MM5H000103 Long Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (71 In.) 382.32

5MM5H000098 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

281.09

5MM5H000150 Mounted Spare Highway Service Tire
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.
S/N XFHT12X900075 and above.

281.09

5MM5H000149 REAR FENDERS (2)
S/N XFHT11X900060 and above.

213.14

5MM5H000099 Rear Fenders, 1 set of 2, Single Rear
S/N XFHT11X000000 - XFHT1X900059.

213.14

5MM5H000145 Short Telescoping Tongue without Hitch (46 In.) 360.45

5MM5H000292 Stalk Bracket 459.00

5MM5H000163 Suspension Front Tricycle Axle 1,118.88

5MM5H000100 Welded Clevis Hitch with Pin No Tongue 120.66

5MM2H000214 Windrower Bracket Set (2)
Standard Duty Transport Only.

329.28
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